
[[ARTISAN BUILDERS]] TAKEUCHI TL12V2 412007110 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP409453
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: ARTISAN BUILDERS

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Elevated aluminum(Al) and/or lead (Pb) and potassium(K) levels in your metals analysis arelikely a result of solder flux releaseinto the lubricant and is common onnew equipment/components. Test forglycol is negative. The oil viscosity islower than normal. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10806567Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 29 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06045959 (Generated: 12/29/2023 14:39:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409453 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 50 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 27 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 50 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 38 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 24 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 142 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 137 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2650 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 16 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 523 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 389 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 150 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06045959 (Generated: 12/29/2023 14:39:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL12V2 412007110\Diesel Engine [VCP409453] 21 Dec 2023 @ 50.0 hrs

