
[[2863]] VOLVO A40G 352341 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP331581
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILFLUID 424
Job No: 2863

SCHILDBERG CONSTRUCTION COMPANYPO BOX 358GREENFIELD, IAUS  50849Contact: SCOTT ARMSTRONGsarmstrong@schildberg.comT: (641)743-8237F: (641)743-2486
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCHGREUnique No: 10807037Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 28 Dec 2023
Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06046429 (Generated: 12/28/2023 15:11:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP331581 VCP312547 VCP406464 VCP395615Sample Date 11 Dec 2023 03 Oct 2023 13 Jul 2023 27 Apr 2023Machine Hours 7087 6606 5997 5474Oil Hours 1090 609 1980 1457Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.9 44.9 42.6 42.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 16 17 15 17Sodium ppm 5 4 7 7Potassium ppm <1 1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 26 23 22Copper ppm 99 106 110 115Lead ppm 0 0 2 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 1 0 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 4 5 5 5Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3323 3410 2979 3326Magnesium ppm 14 12 13 15Zinc ppm 1433 1474 1295 1495Phosphorus ppm 1175 1201 1090 1231Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 104 119 107 98

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCHGRE [WUSCAR] 06046429 (Generated: 12/28/2023 15:11:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT ARMSTRONG - SCHGRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352341\Wet Disc Brake [VCP331581] 11 Dec 2023 @ 7087.0 hrs

