
[[D13105]] VOLVO A40G 342238 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP440567
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: D13105

ARING EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC - MAIN (MILWAUKEE)13001 W SILVERE SPRING DRBUTLER, WIUS  53007Contact: GLENN OTTENBACHERgottenbacher@aring.comT: (262)282-0715F: (262)781-5053
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0069Unique No: 10807053Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0069 [WUSCAR] 06046445 (Generated: 12/29/2023 10:42:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GLENN OTTENBACHER - VOLVO0069

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440567 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8747 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 242 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1064 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 17 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 30 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 10 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 269 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 41 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 192 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 993 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 114 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0069 [WUSCAR] 06046445 (Generated: 12/29/2023 10:42:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GLENN OTTENBACHER - VOLVO0069
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342238\Drop Box [VCP440567] 20 Dec 2023 @ 8747.0 hrs

