
[[E15135 TRAVIS DIONNE]] PONSEE A1305625 - FRONT REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP419198
Oil Type: PONSSE 75W90
Job No: E15135 TRAVIS DIONNE

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC314 MAIN STREETCARIBOU, MEUS  04736Contact: ADAM THERIAULTtheriault@chadwick-baross.comT: F: (207)498-6596
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0010Unique No: 10807663Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 29 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 06047055 (Generated: 12/29/2023 12:49:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM THERIAULT - VOLVO0010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419198 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 239 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 134 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 18 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 500 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 5 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1225 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 471 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 06047055 (Generated: 12/29/2023 12:49:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ADAM THERIAULT - VOLVO0010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PONSEE PONSEE A1305625\Front Rear Right Final Drive [VCP419198] 17 Nov 2023 @ 239.0 hrs

