
[[SW1027987 DIAMOND]] VOLVO A40D 60013 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP415122
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO 400 MULTIGRADE 15W40
Job No: SW1027987 DIAMOND

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10808099Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 02 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06047491 (Generated: 01/02/2024 09:08:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415122 VC109922 VC027460 VC043174Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 23 Apr 2004 29 Dec 2003 14 Mar 2003Machine Hours 4671 3941 3263 2053Oil Hours 0 0 545 674Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.7 14.77 12.9 12.56Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 69 --- --- 40
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 0.120 NEG NEGSoot % % 2.9 2.3 1.1 0.9Nitration (PA) % 89 55 50 40Sulfation (PA) % 69 --- 97 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 6 1 9Sodium ppm 2 <1 2 3Potassium ppm 0 2 4 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 28 80 50 46Copper ppm 1 4 3 11Lead ppm 9 12 7 2Tin ppm 1 1 0 0Aluminum ppm 3 3 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 73 10 9 13Nickel ppm 0 4 3 4Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 2 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1740 3000 3380 2217Magnesium ppm 588 8 12 470Zinc ppm 1329 1142 1381 1374Phosphorus ppm 1106 1005 1174 1211Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 32 2 1 18

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06047491 (Generated: 01/02/2024 09:08:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 60013\Diesel Engine [VCP415122] 20 Dec 2023 @ 4671.0 hrs

