
[[SWO-068518]] TAKEUCHI TL6 406002994 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP447596
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-068518

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition. The fluid wasnot specified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 30Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirm theoil type and grade, and specify thebrand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a moderate amountof fuel present in the oil. Testsconfirm the presence of fuel in theoil. The BN result indicates that thereis suitable alkalinity remaining in theoil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10809263Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 04 Jan 2024
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06048655 (Generated: 01/04/2024 11:53:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447596 VCP380770 --- ---Sample Date 27 Dec 2023 16 Jan 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1840 674 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 13.6 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.8 9.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 86 76 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.7 0.4 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 88 83 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 62 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 5.4 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 12 10 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 16 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 35 42 --- ---Copper ppm 6 58 --- ---Lead ppm <1 5 --- ---Tin ppm <1 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 5 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 54 74 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1390 1333 --- ---Magnesium ppm 819 1108 --- ---Zinc ppm 1237 1473 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 997 1159 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 17 5 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06048655 (Generated: 01/04/2024 11:53:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL6 406002994\Diesel Engine [VCP447596] 27 Dec 2023 @ 1840.0 hrs

