
[[X48285]] VOLVO EC350EL 310659 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP435974
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X48285

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lake CharlesPO BOX 16955LAKE CHARLES, LAUS  70616Contact: TINA LEDOUXtledoux@scottcompanies.comT: (337)433-9811F: (318)433-6623
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO6244Unique No: 10809267Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 06048659 (Generated: 01/03/2024 11:54:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TINA LEDOUX - VOLVO6244

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435974 VCP416453 VCP378232 VCP391025Sample Date 22 Dec 2023 21 Jul 2023 07 Feb 2023 27 Oct 2022Machine Hours 7067 6117 4999 4170Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 11.9 12.2 11.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.8 6.3 7.0 7.8Oxidation (PA) % 66 73 67 73
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 72 75 73 77Sulfation (PA) % 56 58 55 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.5Silicon ppm 7 8 9 8Sodium ppm 4 4 3 5Potassium ppm <1 0 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 8 8 6Copper ppm 2 2 2 4Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 286 311 273 295Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1049 1153 1043 1100Magnesium ppm 979 1022 903 920Zinc ppm 1283 1307 1166 1203Phosphorus ppm 1106 1130 974 1087Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 7 8 0 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 06048659 (Generated: 01/03/2024 11:54:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TINA LEDOUX - VOLVO6244
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310659\Diesel Engine [VCP435974] 22 Dec 2023 @ 7067.0 hrs

