
[[SWO-068517]] EPIROC D60-10 TMG23SED0506 - DRILLING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP449241
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWO-068517

WHITAKER CONTRACTING692 CONVICT CAMP RDGUNTERSVILLE, ALUS  35976Contact: BROTHER WHITAKERBrotherWhitaker@whitaker-contracting.comT: (256)298-3905F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WHIGUNUnique No: 10809862Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Jan 2024
Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06049254 (Generated: 01/04/2024 09:10:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449241 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 263 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 176 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 22 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 438 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 445 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIGUN [WUSCAR] 06049254 (Generated: 01/04/2024 09:10:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BROTHER WHITAKER - WHIGUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	EPIROC EPIROC D60-10 TMG23SED0506\Drilling Drive [VCP449241] 27 Dec 2023 @ 263.0 hrs

