
[[17]] VOLVO L90H 25192 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP430539
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 17

PLEASANT RIVER LUMBERPO BOX 68DOVER FOXCROFT, MEUS  04426Contact: BURLEY HIGGINSburley@pleasantriverlumber.comT: F: (207)564-8259
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLEDOVUnique No: 10809870Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 03 Jan 2024
Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06049262 (Generated: 01/03/2024 14:36:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430539 VCP387242 VC326532 VCP321981Sample Date 06 Dec 2023 08 Dec 2022 24 Feb 2022 03 Sep 2021Machine Hours 11036 8750 5815 3819Oil Hours 2100 2000 2000 2000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.4 42.6 42.0 40.2
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 6 14 10 10Sodium ppm 0 5 4 8Potassium ppm 0 0 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 52 15 34Copper ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 2 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 <1Chromium ppm 1 1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 0 1 <1 2Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 5Manganese ppm 0 2 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3964 4297 3731 3920Magnesium ppm 9 19 10 11Zinc ppm 1593 1775 1688 1646Phosphorus ppm 1469 1409 1450 1276Barium ppm 4 0 0 0Boron ppm 130 149 118 127

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLEDOV [WUSCAR] 06049262 (Generated: 01/03/2024 14:36:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURLEY HIGGINS - PLEDOV
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 25192\Front Axle [VCP430539] 06 Dec 2023 @ 11036.0 hrs

