
BRODERSON IC35 7812035 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP427345
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10809896Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Jan 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06049288 (Generated: 01/04/2024 10:35:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP427345 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.08 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.003 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06049288 (Generated: 01/04/2024 10:35:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	BRODERSON BRODERSON IC35 7812035\Diesel Fuel [VCP427345] 22 Dec 2023 @ .0 hrs

