
[[X37888]] 752107 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP416847
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: X37888

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Baton Rouge10160 AIRLINE HWYBATON ROUGE, LAUS  70816Contact: BRENT CALDWELLbcaldwell@scottcompanies.comT: (225)293-3683F: (225)292-9658
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO6242Unique No: 10820274Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 06054325 (Generated: 01/10/2024 13:01:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT CALDWELL - VOLVO6242

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416847 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5468 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 58.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.997 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 30 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 160 --- --- ---Copper ppm 31 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 14 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 88 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 62 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2006 --- --- ---Barium ppm 9 --- --- ---Boron ppm 40 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 06054325 (Generated: 01/10/2024 13:01:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT CALDWELL - VOLVO6242
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 752107\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP416847] 21 Dec 2023 @ 5468.0 hrs

