
[[SW1028121 ODDONETTO]] VOLVO A40G 340471 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP430700
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: SW1028121 ODDONETTO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Torque converter wear is indicated.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10820399Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06054450 (Generated: 01/10/2024 09:24:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430700 VCP316317 VCP208255 ---Sample Date 29 Dec 2023 15 Jul 2021 30 Aug 2017 ---Machine Hours 8301 7149 2317 ---Oil Hours 0 0 2317 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.1 26.3 27.27 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.841 NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 18 8 19 ---Sodium ppm 15 5 7 ---Potassium ppm 6 1 4 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 231 75 79 ---Copper ppm 97 58 167 ---Lead ppm 1 0 1 ---Tin ppm 11 6 8 ---Aluminum ppm 55 26 39 ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 16 9 20 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 6 1 6 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 110 92 129 ---Magnesium ppm 10 4 4 ---Zinc ppm 186 12 20 ---Phosphorus ppm 203 161 187 ---Barium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Boron ppm 52 79 59 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06054450 (Generated: 01/10/2024 09:24:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340471\Transmission (Auto) [VCP430700] 29 Dec 2023 @ 8301.0 hrs

