
[[W02007859]] VOLVO L350F 1597 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP412081
Oil Type: MOBIL ATF
Job No: W02007859

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. There is a lightconcentration of water present in thefluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10820409Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06054460 (Generated: 01/10/2024 13:04:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412081 VCP375233 VCP288681 VCP269069Sample Date 03 Jan 2024 08 Jul 2022 02 Oct 2020 17 Jan 2020Machine Hours 17636 15305 12236 10884Oil Hours 2000 2000 0 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.3 29.6 31.1 39.0
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.266 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 13 8 5 5Sodium ppm 6 3 2 2Potassium ppm 4 3 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 264 25 7 5Copper ppm 211 97 27 60Lead ppm 10 4 0 <1Tin ppm 3 1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 2 11Nickel ppm 3 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 13 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 6 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 120 257 715Magnesium ppm 13 10 30 128Zinc ppm 145 86 98 335Phosphorus ppm 160 159 252 424Barium ppm 8 0 <1 0Boron ppm 31 31 42 37

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06054460 (Generated: 01/10/2024 13:04:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L350F 1597\Transmission (Auto) [VCP412081] 03 Jan 2024 @ 17636.0 hrs

