
[[SWO-068630]] EPIROC TMG21SED0492 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP435645
Oil Type: CAT EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT (ELC)
Job No: SWO-068630

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10820473Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Jan 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06054524 (Generated: 01/10/2024 12:11:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435645 VCP428774 VCP428908 VCP429381Sample Date 03 Jan 2024 27 Nov 2023 31 Oct 2023 08 Oct 2023Machine Hours 4772 4529 4296 4048Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 6.57 6.60 6.70 6.84Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT NT NT NTPercentage Glycol % 46.1 47.0 45.9 45.6Freezing Point °C -26 -28 -24 -24
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal normalCoolant Color Red Red Red Yllow

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06054524 (Generated: 01/10/2024 12:11:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	EPIROC EPIROC TMG21SED0492\Coolant [VCP435645] 03 Jan 2024 @ 4772.0 hrs

