
[[W07014012 CT PERCELL]] VOLVO A40F 11629 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP409455
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: W07014012 CT PERCELL

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil viscosity is lower thannormal. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10820496Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06054547 (Generated: 01/12/2024 11:38:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409455 VCP245643 VCP205439 VCP211543Sample Date 02 Jan 2024 23 Oct 2019 30 Mar 2019 22 Feb 2018Machine Hours 8499 6140 5602 5086Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status MARGINAL SEVERE ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.8 12.54 12.88Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 67 68 76 60
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.8 0.4 0.3 0Nitration (PA) % 71 103 67 42Sulfation (PA) % 58 62 59 53Glycol % NEG 0.10 NEG NEGFuel % 0.3 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 10 10 8Sodium ppm 2 1439 169 8Potassium ppm <1 581 10 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 19 15 8Copper ppm 1 40 6 3Lead ppm 1 6 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 4 4 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 54 82 49 38Nickel ppm <1 2 1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1216 1473 1862 1494Magnesium ppm 899 606 594 477Zinc ppm 1355 1077 890 762Phosphorus ppm 1141 881 772 690Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 11 8 39 40

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06054547 (Generated: 01/12/2024 11:38:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40F 11629\Diesel Engine [VCP409455] 02 Jan 2024 @ 8499.0 hrs

