
[[659041]] VOLVO A30 753223 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP437681
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 659041

BLUE GOOSE GROWERS16059 W ORANGE AVEFT PIERCE, FLUS  34945Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (772)461-3020F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: BLUFORUnique No: 10821621Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 10 Jan 2024
Report Id: BLUFOR [WUSCAR] 06055672 (Generated: 01/10/2024 20:28:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - BLUFOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437681 VCP431306 VCP412766 VCP417207Sample Date 04 Jan 2024 16 Oct 2023 07 Aug 2023 03 Jul 2023Machine Hours 1548 1012 511 274Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.2 28.8 29.3 29.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 14 16 12 14Sodium ppm 6 2 0 3Potassium ppm 3 4 0 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 31 18 14Copper ppm 20 19 10 11Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 4 4 <1 2Aluminum ppm 19 17 12 8Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 0Nickel ppm 1 2 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 4 3 1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 67 88 67 72Magnesium ppm 0 <1 0 0Zinc ppm 0 0 0 0Phosphorus ppm 183 167 189 196Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 68 78 84 96

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLUFOR [WUSCAR] 06055672 (Generated: 01/10/2024 20:28:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - BLUFOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30 753223\Transmission (Auto) [VCP437681] 04 Jan 2024 @ 1548.0 hrs

