
[[11848]] VOLVO A40G 342316 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP408148
Oil Type: VOLVO AT3
Job No: 11848

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10822063Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 10 Jan 2024
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 06056114 (Generated: 01/10/2024 20:31:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408148 VCP411872 VCP335651 VCP308592Sample Date 05 Jan 2024 06 Jul 2023 09 Sep 2021 20 Apr 2021Machine Hours 5803 5600 4315 0Oil Hours 203 1000 2000 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed N/ASample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.4 28.4 29.6 29.9
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 4 5 2Sodium ppm 4 3 3 5Potassium ppm 1 2 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 19 20 25 22Copper ppm 15 16 26 18Lead ppm 0 <1 1 0Tin ppm 2 2 2 2Aluminum ppm 9 10 9 7Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm <1 2 6 6Nickel ppm 2 2 2 2Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 122 143 231 213Magnesium ppm 7 8 16 16Zinc ppm 23 40 93 91Phosphorus ppm 208 216 222 220Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 77 76 62 75

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 06056114 (Generated: 01/10/2024 20:31:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342316\Transmission (Auto) [VCP408148] 05 Jan 2024 @ 5803.0 hrs

