
[[646160 DIPRO]] CATERPILLAR 972M HLSJ02687 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP452308
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 646160 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. The oil change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is a highamount of fuel present in the oil.Tests confirm the presence of fuel inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. Fuel is present in the oiland is lowering the viscosity. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10822405Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06056456 (Generated: 01/16/2024 10:59:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452308 VCP431157 VCP414163 VCP426804Sample Date 27 Dec 2023 25 Sep 2023 10 Jul 2023 17 Apr 2023Machine Hours 15831 15087 14435 13394Oil Hours 500 500 0 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ChangedSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 8.85 7 6.8 5.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.7 3.6 1.0 0.7Oxidation (PA) % 96 118 189 222
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.4 0.7 0.6Nitration (PA) % 101 90 135 167Sulfation (PA) % 62 69 91 96Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 19.8 36.9 33.0 41.4Silicon ppm 4 3 6 8Sodium ppm 3 2 4 3Potassium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 23 51 50Copper ppm 2 2 2 1Lead ppm <1 2 16 10Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 4 <1 5 5Chromium ppm 2 1 3 3Molybdenum ppm 47 37 35 29Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 787 628 659 537Magnesium ppm 747 591 597 471Zinc ppm 951 742 770 611Phosphorus ppm 776 588 651 494Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 <1 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06056456 (Generated: 01/16/2024 10:59:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 972M HLSJ02687\Diesel Engine [VCP452308] 27 Dec 2023 @ 15831.0 hrs

