
[[436205 STONE PLUS]] VOLVO L35G 03420312 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP429433
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W140
Job No: 436205 STONE PLUS

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance isunacceptable There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10822933Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 11 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06056984 (Generated: 01/11/2024 16:15:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHAWN NORTHCRAFT - VOLVO0092

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429433 VCP287505 --- ---Sample Date 05 Jan 2024 10 Jun 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 5015 3184 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A --- ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 330 230 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 2.12 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 6 3 --- ---Sodium ppm 35 0 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 157 175 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 20 30 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 10 --- ---Zinc ppm 3 20 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1017 651 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 167 18 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06056984 (Generated: 01/11/2024 16:15:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHAWN NORTHCRAFT - VOLVO0092
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L35G 03420312\Front Axle [VCP429433] 05 Jan 2024 @ 5014.8 hrs

