
[[SPM697543-10]] VOLVO A45G 352374 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP422312
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80
Job No: SPM697543-10

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: SHAWN NORTHCRAFTshawn.northcraft@altg.comT: (904)737-6000F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the reported failure.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10822935Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 11 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06056986 (Generated: 01/12/2024 13:22:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHAWN NORTHCRAFT - VOLVO0092

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422312 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4085 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 60.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 50 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 287 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 17 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 131 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1876 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 106 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06056986 (Generated: 01/12/2024 13:22:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SHAWN NORTHCRAFT - VOLVO0092
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352374\Drop Box [VCP422312] 06 Jan 2024 @ 4085.0 hrs

