
[[646971]] VOLVO EC380 311542 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP452295
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 646971

FERROUS PROCESSING AND TRADING3400 E LAFAYETTEDETROIT, MIUS  48207Contact: KEITH HALLkeith.hall@fpt1.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: FERDETUnique No: 10822955Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Jan 2024
Report Id: FERDET [WUSCAR] 06057006 (Generated: 01/11/2024 13:34:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH HALL - FERDET

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452295 --- --- ---Sample Date 20 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3878 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 155 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 128 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 31 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 35 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1596 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 123 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: FERDET [WUSCAR] 06057006 (Generated: 01/11/2024 13:34:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEITH HALL - FERDET
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380 311542\Swing Drive [VCP452295] 20 Dec 2023 @ 3878.0 hrs

