
[[645918]] VOLVO A40G 341242 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP452279
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: 645918

BLAZE CONSTRUCTION5640 ST JEAN STDETROIT, MIUS  48213Contact: DAVE WARDdward@blazecontracting.netT: (248)632-2317F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. The ironlevel is abnormal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: BLADETUnique No: 10822959Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 11 Jan 2024
Report Id: BLADET [WUSCAR] 06057010 (Generated: 01/11/2024 16:16:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE WARD - BLADET

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP452279 VCP393260 VCP344277 ---Sample Date 19 Dec 2023 01 Apr 2023 01 Sep 2021 ---Machine Hours 10855 9962 7958 ---Oil Hours 1000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.9 40.9 40.8 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 13 13 10 ---Sodium ppm 4 5 1 ---Potassium ppm 2 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 46 48 35 ---Copper ppm 381 290 357 ---Lead ppm 0 3 1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 0 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 2 2 4 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 2 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3567 3498 3729 ---Magnesium ppm 14 20 7 ---Zinc ppm 1510 1436 1435 ---Phosphorus ppm 1210 1177 1300 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 134 112 118 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLADET [WUSCAR] 06057010 (Generated: 01/11/2024 16:16:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE WARD - BLADET
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341242\Wet Disc Brake [VCP452279] 19 Dec 2023 @ 10855.0 hrs

