
[[X37784 WASTE PRO]] 312653 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP416888
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: X37784 WASTE PRO

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Baton Rouge10160 AIRLINE HWYBATON ROUGE, LAUS  70816Contact: BRENT CALDWELLbcaldwell@scottcompanies.comT: (225)293-3683F: (225)292-9658
Diagnosis
We recommend drain system, andrefill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is lower than acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO6242Unique No: 10823129Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 06057180 (Generated: 01/12/2024 15:00:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT CALDWELL - VOLVO6242

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416888 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 9.37 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 26.3 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C 9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6242 [WUSCAR] 06057180 (Generated: 01/12/2024 15:01:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENT CALDWELL - VOLVO6242
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 312653\Coolant [VCP416888] 12 Dec 2023 @ .0 hrs

