
[UPAP-ORLANDO [9469]] 617406 VOLVO L90G 617406 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP401170
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 9469

U-PULL-AND-PAY LLC - ORLANDO1157 JETSTREAM DRIVEORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: NILDA RIOSnilda.rios@upullandpay.comT: (407)473-3798F: (407)856-4029
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The oil viscosity islower than normal. Confirm oil type.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: UPUORLUnique No: 10829402Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Jan 2024
Report Id: UPUORL [WUSCAR] 06058020 (Generated: 01/16/2024 14:02:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NILDA RIOS - UPUORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP401170 VCP417701 VCP385390 VCP356923Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 11 Jul 2023 28 Dec 2022 05 Jul 2022Machine Hours 14951 14237 13731 13038Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 37.3 47.6 48.8 49.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.611 0.35 0.30 0.33
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 25255 29058 3783 7583Particles >6µm 4031 8820 324 1913Particles >14µm 80 605 15 106ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/13 22/20/16 19/16/11 20/18/14Silicon ppm 2 4 4 3Sodium ppm 0 2 2 <1Potassium ppm 1 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 11 7 5Copper ppm 2 2 2 1Lead ppm <1 0 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 0 <1 0Chromium ppm 2 2 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 39 69 76 63Magnesium ppm 2 5 5 2Zinc ppm 417 427 434 434Phosphorus ppm 351 345 346 347Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UPUORL [WUSCAR] 06058020 (Generated: 01/16/2024 14:02:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NILDA RIOS - UPUORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 617406 VOLVO L90G 617406\Hydraulic System [VCP401170] 08 Jan 2024 @ 14951.0 hrs

