
[[10165 TOLSON]] ALJON 30131 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP414785
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 32
Job No: 10165 TOLSON

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 32.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.The system cleanliness is acceptablefor your target ISO 4406 cleanlinesscode. The system and fluidcleanliness is acceptable. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10829405Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 12 Jan 2024
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06058023 (Generated: 01/12/2024 11:53:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414785 VCP426082 VCP422892 VCP407891Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 20 Sep 2023 24 Jul 2023 01 Jun 2023Machine Hours 2490 1938 1665 1445Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.8 27.6 27.6 26.6Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.43 0.38 0.43 0.44
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 2655 --- 17675 1500Particles >6µm 690 --- 787 667Particles >14µm 76 --- 27 146ISO 4406:1999 (c) 19/17/13 --- 21/17/12 18/17/14Silicon ppm <1 2 1 2Sodium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Potassium ppm 2 <1 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 11 8 9Copper ppm 6 21 17 20Lead ppm <1 1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 1 1 2Aluminum ppm 2 0 0 0Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm <1 1 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 109 107 118Magnesium ppm 5 9 13 13Zinc ppm 493 331 305 379Phosphorus ppm 449 398 397 392Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06058023 (Generated: 01/12/2024 11:53:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30131\Hydraulic System [VCP414785] 08 Jan 2024 @ 2490.0 hrs

