
[UPAP-ORLANDO [9469]] 617406 VOLVO L90G 617406 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP412047
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 9469

U-PULL-AND-PAY LLC - ORLANDO1157 JETSTREAM DRIVEORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: NILDA RIOSnilda.rios@upullandpay.comT: (407)473-3798F: (407)856-4029
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: UPUORLUnique No: 10829778Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jan 2024
Report Id: UPUORL [WUSCAR] 06058396 (Generated: 01/16/2024 14:01:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NILDA RIOS - UPUORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412047 VCP417704 VCP389641 VCP337744Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 11 Jul 2023 28 Dec 2022 05 Jul 2022Machine Hours 14951 14237 13731 13038Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 43.3 42.4 42.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.243 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 14 15 14 13Sodium ppm 3 3 4 6Potassium ppm <1 0 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 23 24 21 19Copper ppm 1 2 2 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 2 2 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3712 4088 3990 4099Magnesium ppm 30 29 29 30Zinc ppm 1636 1653 1600 1536Phosphorus ppm 1336 1305 1268 1256Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 127 123 128 144

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UPUORL [WUSCAR] 06058396 (Generated: 01/16/2024 14:02:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: NILDA RIOS - UPUORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 617406 VOLVO L90G 617406\Front Axle [VCP412047] 08 Jan 2024 @ 14951.0 hrs

