
[[10165 TOLSON]] ALJON 30131 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP409472
Oil Type: SHELL SPIRAX HD 85W140
Job No: 10165 TOLSON

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10829783Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jan 2024
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06058401 (Generated: 01/14/2024 13:44:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409472 VCP426063 VCP412702 VCP408896Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 20 Sep 2023 24 Jul 2023 01 Jun 2023Machine Hours 2490 1938 1665 1445Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 263 299 296 295
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 5 4 5Sodium ppm 0 3 1 1Potassium ppm <1 6 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 308 856 686 590Copper ppm 3 10 7 4Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 1 3 <1Chromium ppm 3 6 5 5Molybdenum ppm 0 1 <1 1Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 8 7 6Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 78 121 104 113Magnesium ppm 2 6 0 <1Zinc ppm 27 55 41 32Phosphorus ppm 1114 930 915 1010Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 68 147 151 168

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06058401 (Generated: 01/14/2024 13:44:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30131\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP409472] 08 Jan 2024 @ 2490.0 hrs

