
[[10165 TOLSON]] ALJON 30131 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP409396
Oil Type: SHELL SPIRAX HD 85W140
Job No: 10165 TOLSON

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10829785Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Jan 2024
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06058403 (Generated: 01/14/2024 13:44:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409396 VCP426081 VCP412653 VCP408887Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 20 Sep 2023 24 Jul 2023 01 Jun 2023Machine Hours 2490 1938 1665 1445Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 304 292 293 294
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2 4 3 3Sodium ppm 0 4 1 2Potassium ppm <1 5 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 167 395 317 268Copper ppm 4 10 7 6Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 <1 2 <1Chromium ppm 2 2 2 2Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 4 3 3Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 66 102 108 141Magnesium ppm 2 5 0 0Zinc ppm 19 47 43 40Phosphorus ppm 687 954 925 1021Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 117 172 167 191

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06058403 (Generated: 01/14/2024 13:44:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30131\Front Right Final Drive [VCP409396] 08 Jan 2024 @ 2490.0 hrs

