
[[60873]] DOOSAN P185 497071UKADG89 - COMPRESSOR

Sample No: VCP418470
Oil Type: PRO-TEC COMPRESSOR FLUID
Job No: 60873

114 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CONCORD1025 INTERNATIONAL DR NWCONCORD, NCUS  28027Contact: CEB SMITHceb.smith@ascendummachinery.comT: (704)596-8283F: (704)596-1362
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0016Unique No: 10829913Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 12 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0016 [WUSCAR] 06058531 (Generated: 01/12/2024 14:51:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CEB SMITH - VOLVO0016

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418470 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1622 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 0 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 17 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 19 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0016 [WUSCAR] 06058531 (Generated: 01/12/2024 14:52:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CEB SMITH - VOLVO0016
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	DOOSAN DOOSAN P185 497071UKADG89\Compressor [VCP418470] 08 Jan 2024 @ 1622.0 hrs

