
[[2707-1 MT FUELS]] VOLVO EC210CL 111723 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP441062
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 2707-1 MT FUELS

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - WISEPO BOX 1158WISE, VAUS  24293Contact: DANNY BARRINGTONdbarrington@mcclung-logan.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. We recommendthat you drain the oil from thecomponent if this has not alreadybeen done. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor this condition.Please specify the brand, type, andviscosity of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is a high amount offuel present in the oil. Tests confirmthe presence of fuel in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8881Unique No: 10830455Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8881 [WUSCAR] 06059073 (Generated: 01/16/2024 09:45:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY BARRINGTON - VOLVO8881

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441062 VCP234776 VCP122149 ---Sample Date 09 Jan 2024 08 Oct 2019 13 Feb 2015 ---Machine Hours 12413 0 3218 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A ---Sample Status SEVERE ATTENTION ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.1 19.6 17.97 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.6 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 46 63 28 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0 0.3 0 ---Nitration (PA) % 43 54 33 ---Sulfation (PA) % 45 57 36 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % 39.9 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 6 4 5 ---Sodium ppm <1 <1 5 ---Potassium ppm <1 5 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 5 62 ---Copper ppm 5 <1 1 ---Lead ppm 1 0 7 ---Tin ppm 0 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 1 4 ---Chromium ppm 1 <1 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 19 <1 44 ---Nickel ppm 1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 798 1730 1212 ---Magnesium ppm 257 9 759 ---Zinc ppm 625 876 971 ---Phosphorus ppm 509 712 684 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 24 132 35 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8881 [WUSCAR] 06059073 (Generated: 01/16/2024 09:45:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANNY BARRINGTON - VOLVO8881
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC210CL 111723\Diesel Engine [VCP441062] 09 Jan 2024 @ 12413.0 hrs

