
[[SWA450923-20 M SQUAR]] TAKEUCHI TB235-2 123601919 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP434302
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT (GREEN)
Job No: SWA450923-20 M SQUAR

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10831121Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 17 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06059739 (Generated: 01/17/2024 19:59:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434302 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1720 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.25 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 600 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 52.4 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -40 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Green --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06059739 (Generated: 01/17/2024 19:59:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TB235-2 123601919\Coolant [VCP434302] 09 Jan 2024 @ 1720.0 hrs

