
VOLVO ECR305CL 00110439 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP437982
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: STEPHEN SALMERONssalmeron@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
 

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10831562Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 16 Jan 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06060180 (Generated: 01/16/2024 12:53:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHEN SALMERON - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437982 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5085 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.54 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Particles >4µm 45297 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 5619 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 207 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 --- --- ---Copper ppm 31 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 447 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 20 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 577 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 506 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06060180 (Generated: 01/16/2024 12:53:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHEN SALMERON - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR305CL 00110439\Hydraulic System [VCP437982] 10 Jan 2024 @ 5085.0 hrs

