
[[9320]] PETERSON 5710D 40D-2952749 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437691
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 9320

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. Test forglycol is positive. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10832039Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06060657 (Generated: 01/17/2024 21:25:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437691 VCP412623 --- ---Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 24 Aug 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1361 841 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE MARGINAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.1 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 9.1 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 91 76 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.6 0.3 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 93 71 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 66 60 --- ---Glycol % 0.10 0.0 --- ---Fuel % <1.0 3.8 --- ---Silicon ppm 10 12 --- ---Sodium ppm 501 88 --- ---Potassium ppm 130 42 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 61 28 --- ---Copper ppm 182 15 --- ---Lead ppm 9 2 --- ---Tin ppm 2 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 17 19 --- ---Chromium ppm 4 3 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 57 46 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 13 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1594 1719 --- ---Magnesium ppm 489 500 --- ---Zinc ppm 1122 1117 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 922 896 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 21 26 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06060657 (Generated: 01/17/2024 21:25:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PETERSON PETERSON 5710D 40D-2952749\Diesel Engine [VCP437691] 10 Jan 2024 @ 1361.0 hrs

