
[[S50100644 RAMONA DIS]] VOLVO L120 66542 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP337867
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: S50100644 RAMONA DIS

VCES- VOLVO CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT12345 MAPLEVIEW STREETLAKESIDE, CAUS  92040Contact: Mark Stewartmark.stewart@vcesvolvo.comT:  X:F:  X:
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. Viscosity of sampleindicates oil is within ISO 68 range,advise investigate. Confirm oil type.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: VOLVO4488Unique No: 10832357Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 17 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO4488 [WUSCAR] 06060975 (Generated: 01/17/2024 11:22:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mark Stewart - VOLVO4488

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP337867 VCP350229 VCP289884 VCP102513Sample Date 05 Jan 2024 19 Jul 2022 03 Nov 2020 15 Jun 2011Machine Hours 39357 37068 32930 7292Oil Hours 0 0 0 4000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 66.9 67.5 66.11 46.94Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.46 0.37 0.398 0.596
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 20565 103652 21022 7754Particles >6µm 1545 15711 3087 4224Particles >14µm 65 99 218 719ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/18/13 24/21/14 22/19/15 20/19/17Silicon ppm <1 2 <1 9Sodium ppm <1 0 0 5Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 3 3 5Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 0 3 0 4Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 4 2 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 84 86 90 79Magnesium ppm 0 11 18 2Zinc ppm 440 425 440 411Phosphorus ppm 347 343 336 328Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 1 4 4 5

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO4488 [WUSCAR] 06060975 (Generated: 01/17/2024 11:22:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Mark Stewart - VOLVO4488
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120 66542\Hydraulic System [VCP337867] 05 Jan 2024 @ 39357.0 hrs

