
[[14062]] JOHN DEERE 644K 659926 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP414786
Oil Type: SHELL 15W40
Job No: 14062

ALLIED CONCRETE3900 SHANNON STCHESAPEAKE, VAUS  23324Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ALLCHEVAUnique No: 10833693Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 18 Jan 2024
Report Id: ALLCHEVA [WUSCAR] 06062311 (Generated: 01/19/2024 13:28:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - ALLCHEVA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414786 VCP405062 VCP363671 VCP358924Sample Date 04 Jan 2024 17 Apr 2023 04 Nov 2022 26 Aug 2022Machine Hours 14947 14098 13594 13345Oil Hours 500 550 500 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.6 14.1 14.2 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.0 6.8 8.1 14.8Oxidation (PA) % 65 59 46 73
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.5 0.5 0.5Nitration (PA) % 73 68 68 115Sulfation (PA) % 57 56 52 69Glycol % NEG NEG NEG 0.10Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 5 9 109Sodium ppm 13 32 148 2154Potassium ppm 3 6 7 99
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 14 13 67Copper ppm 2 7 5 55Lead ppm <1 0 2 16Tin ppm 0 0 <1 2Aluminum ppm 2 <1 4 40Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 2Molybdenum ppm 54 34 12 84Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 2Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1997 2397 2152 1183Magnesium ppm 199 42 130 662Zinc ppm 1201 1262 1074 931Phosphorus ppm 1023 1054 846 726Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 70 92 8 50

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALLCHEVA [WUSCAR] 06062311 (Generated: 01/19/2024 13:28:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - ALLCHEVA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 644K 659926\Diesel Engine [VCP414786] 04 Jan 2024 @ 14947.0 hrs

