
[[SW-27393-3 DAZ]] VOLVO L90H 625190 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP439407
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: SW-27393-3 DAZ

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Oil and filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount offuel present in the oil. Fuel is presentin the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10835354Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06063972 (Generated: 01/20/2024 12:03:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439407 VCP435898 VCP375278 VCP355904Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 04 Jan 2024 22 Aug 2022 12 Jul 2022Machine Hours 4006 4000 1748 1502Oil Hours 110 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 9.1 7.8 13.5 14.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.0 8.7 9.5 8.4Oxidation (PA) % 51 48 57 81
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.5 0.5 0.4 1.7Nitration (PA) % 50 49 55 103Sulfation (PA) % 51 50 57 77Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 13.9 16.9 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 19 28 6 18Sodium ppm 0 0 2 3Potassium ppm 2 1 2 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 26 16 18 107Copper ppm 2 1 2 17Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 4Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 4Aluminum ppm 12 10 9 58Chromium ppm 2 2 2 8Molybdenum ppm 54 48 65 37Nickel ppm 0 <1 1 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 5Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 957 843 1237 1283Magnesium ppm 830 714 630 758Zinc ppm 1100 967 1194 1082Phosphorus ppm 848 797 994 899Barium ppm 3 0 0 0Boron ppm 6 5 154 32

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06063972 (Generated: 01/20/2024 12:03:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625190\Diesel Engine [VCP439407] 10 Jan 2024 @ 4006.0 hrs

