
[[659872]] VOLVO L150H 6945 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP437450
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 659872

ORANGE COUNTY SOLID WASTE5901 YOUNG PINE ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: MICHAEL BEEBEmichael.beebe@ocfl.netT: (407)836-6652F: (407)836-6650
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: ORAORLUnique No: 10836037Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 21 Jan 2024
Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06064655 (Generated: 01/21/2024 13:31:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437450 VCP432767 VCP408205 VCP368014Sample Date 15 Jan 2024 05 Sep 2023 30 Mar 2023 07 Jan 2023Machine Hours 7995 6908 5534 4991Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 27.8 27.9 26.85
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 8 8 6Sodium ppm 0 5 5 1Potassium ppm 1 <1 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 36 104 80 74Copper ppm 6 17 13 13Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 5 5 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 71 92 84 78Magnesium ppm 0 3 6 2Zinc ppm 0 25 32 27Phosphorus ppm 224 200 196 180Barium ppm 4 4 6 6Boron ppm 89 52 55 59

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06064655 (Generated: 01/21/2024 13:31:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6945\Transmission (Auto) [VCP437450] 15 Jan 2024 @ 7995.0 hrs

