
[[SW1027988 DIAMOND MA]] VOLVO A40D 12032 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP412914
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: SW1027988 DIAMOND MA

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Light concentration ofcarbon/soot present in the oil. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10836670Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 23 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06065288 (Generated: 01/23/2024 10:28:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412914 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6905 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.8 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 54 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 3.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 75 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 12 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 25 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 62 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1256 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 758 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1214 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1050 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 17 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 06065288 (Generated: 01/23/2024 10:28:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 12032\Diesel Engine [VCP412914] 03 Jan 2024 @ 6905.0 hrs

