
[[24745]] VOLVO EC300E 311876 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP440962
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 24745

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.No other contaminants weredetected in the oil. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10836845Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 23 Jan 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06065463 (Generated: 01/23/2024 12:06:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440962 VCP416524 VCP388293 VCP358205Sample Date 05 Jan 2024 20 Jun 2023 13 Dec 2022 30 Aug 2022Machine Hours 6600 6086 5659 5141Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 12.8 13.1 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 10.8 8.0 11.4Oxidation (PA) % 83 83 83 86
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.5 0.2Nitration (PA) % 58 57 106 68Sulfation (PA) % 61 62 63 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 1.4 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 12 9 9 9Sodium ppm 2 0 0 3Potassium ppm <1 3 5 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 7 9 10Copper ppm 2 2 2 4Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 2 5 5Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 50 45 43 42Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1679 1715 1787 1563Magnesium ppm 536 496 503 521Zinc ppm 1152 1101 1118 970Phosphorus ppm 957 941 935 775Barium ppm 0 0 <1 2Boron ppm 45 61 41 33

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06065463 (Generated: 01/23/2024 12:06:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300E 311876\Diesel Engine [VCP440962] 05 Jan 2024 @ 6600.0 hrs

