
[[SW-2496-2 STAKER]] VOLVO L220H 2572 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP438055
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: SW-2496-2 STAKER

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TJ LARKtlark@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of metal.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Moderate concentrationof visible metal present. Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10842687Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06066010 (Generated: 01/23/2024 11:03:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP438055 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 17253 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 33.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 92 --- --- ---Copper ppm 131 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 10 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 232 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 151 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 197 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 366 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 71 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06066010 (Generated: 01/23/2024 11:03:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 2572\Transmission [VCP438055] 11 Jan 2024 @ 17253.0 hrs

