
VOLVO L30G 3224032 - RESERVOIR ANTI-FREEZE

Sample No: VCP0008159
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the anti-freeze. Carboxylate test failed. Theglycol level is acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10842743Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 05 Feb 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06066066 (Generated: 02/08/2024 17:30:06) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0008159 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 06066066 (Generated: 02/08/2024 17:30:08) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L30G 3224032\Reservoir Anti-Freeze [VCP0008159] 17 Jan 2024 @ .0 hrs

