
VOLVO A60H 350187 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP410911
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No:

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Exhaustvalve wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10844813Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Jan 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06068136 (Generated: 01/25/2024 13:17:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410911 VCP428996 VCP357978 VCP395400Sample Date 11 Jan 2024 06 Sep 2023 09 Mar 2023 28 Feb 2023Machine Hours 2513 2021 1585 1556Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ATTENTION SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 12.7 13.4 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 10.3 11.3 11.6Oxidation (PA) % 71 75 75 79
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.1 0.3Nitration (PA) % 53 46 43 63Sulfation (PA) % 57 58 60 61Glycol % NEG NEG 0.0 0.10Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 4 5Sodium ppm 1 12 56 382Potassium ppm 2 <1 6 42
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 8 3 12Copper ppm 2 1 3 17Lead ppm 1 0 0 0Tin ppm 2 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 45 42 42 44Nickel ppm 6 1 <1 4Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1449 1862 1639 1734Magnesium ppm 596 532 495 520Zinc ppm 1140 1172 1108 1110Phosphorus ppm 933 964 898 921Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 45 63 64 24

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06068136 (Generated: 01/25/2024 13:17:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350187\Diesel Engine [VCP410911] 11 Jan 2024 @ 2513.0 hrs

