
[[X59119]] VOLVO A25G 752694 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP441136
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: X59119

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DENISE CORVERSdcorvers@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Thecopper level has decreased, but is stillabnormal. In the absence of othersignificant wear metals, suspectcopper due to sources other thanwear (i.e. cooling core). All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 10844822Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Jan 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06068145 (Generated: 01/27/2024 13:40:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DENISE CORVERS - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441136 VCP413451 --- ---Sample Date 17 Jan 2024 07 Oct 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1805 1230 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.7 12.5 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.4 7.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 82 79 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Soot % % 0.3 0.4 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 66 68 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 61 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 5 8 --- ---Sodium ppm 0 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 8 --- ---Copper ppm 59 209 --- ---Lead ppm 1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 2 1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 4 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 41 44 --- ---Nickel ppm 6 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 2 1 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1644 1682 --- ---Magnesium ppm 468 400 --- ---Zinc ppm 1192 1158 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 907 945 --- ---Barium ppm <1 2 --- ---Boron ppm 45 31 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06068145 (Generated: 01/27/2024 13:40:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DENISE CORVERS - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752694\Diesel Engine [VCP441136] 17 Jan 2024 @ 1805.0 hrs

