
[[0630]] VOLVO EC750E 314043 - RIGHT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP439246
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 0630

BLUE GOOSE GROWERS16059 W ORANGE AVEFT PIERCE, FLUS  34945Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (772)461-3020F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance isunacceptable There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: BLUFORUnique No: 10845459Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 25 Jan 2024
Report Id: BLUFOR [WUSCAR] 06068782 (Generated: 01/25/2024 13:26:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - BLUFOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439246 VCP440111 VCP417716 VCP400784Sample Date 17 Jan 2024 21 Sep 2023 05 Jul 2023 20 Apr 2023Machine Hours 4913 4441 3974 3513Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 312 301 250 250
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 2.65 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 10 7 7 7Sodium ppm 4 0 <1 <1Potassium ppm 1 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 187 39 137 145Copper ppm 9 2 9 13Lead ppm <1 <1 0 0Tin ppm 2 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 3 8 8Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 71 67 130 141Magnesium ppm 16 16 39 45Zinc ppm 55 52 100 105Phosphorus ppm 1069 1021 992 963Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 139 199 169 170

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLUFOR [WUSCAR] 06068782 (Generated: 01/25/2024 13:26:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - BLUFOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC750E 314043\Right Swing Drive [VCP439246] 17 Jan 2024 @ 4913.0 hrs

