
VOLVO A60H 350187 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP410905
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The copper level isabnormal. The iron level is abnormal.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10845470Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 26 Jan 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06068793 (Generated: 01/26/2024 15:16:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410905 VCP428967 VCP402247 VCP388250Sample Date 11 Jan 2024 06 Sep 2023 28 Feb 2023 14 Oct 2022Machine Hours 2513 2021 1556 1098Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 44.1 42.0 41.3
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 22 26 26 25Sodium ppm 10 11 13 10Potassium ppm 0 3 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 51 69 74 61Copper ppm 334 280 293 217Lead ppm 3 4 3 53Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 0 2 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 2Molybdenum ppm 1 2 0 <1Nickel ppm 4 4 3 3Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 3 4 4Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3543 4196 4410 3986Magnesium ppm 23 31 21 13Zinc ppm 1361 1558 1423 1456Phosphorus ppm 1236 1312 1181 1237Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 124 146 152 123

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06068793 (Generated: 01/26/2024 15:16:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 350187\Wet Disc Brake [VCP410905] 11 Jan 2024 @ 2513.0 hrs

