
[[660621 R BRO]] VOLVO L120H 632683 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP440289
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 660621 R BRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10845482Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06068805 (Generated: 01/24/2024 04:45:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440289 VCP432732 VCP421061 VCP369806Sample Date 16 Jan 2024 31 Aug 2023 11 May 2023 12 Dec 2022Machine Hours 5187 4522 4061 3124Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.3 44.5 54.6 55.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 23 12 12 12Sodium ppm 2 0 2 0Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 34 20 61 43Copper ppm <1 0 0 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 1Molybdenum ppm 4 2 4 4Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 2 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3672 3916 3490 3661Magnesium ppm 33 36 38 32Zinc ppm 1429 1578 1388 1345Phosphorus ppm 1198 1235 1080 1081Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 118 122 77 89

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06068805 (Generated: 01/24/2024 04:45:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632683\Rear Axle [VCP440289] 16 Jan 2024 @ 5187.0 hrs

