
[[10132 MULFORD]] VOLVO A30G 753524 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP432268
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 10132 MULFORD

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - BALTIMORE4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10845882Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 26 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 06069205 (Generated: 01/26/2024 15:20:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432268 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Jan 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 683 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 95.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 215 --- --- ---Copper ppm 16 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 399 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 183 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1327 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 268 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 06069205 (Generated: 01/26/2024 15:20:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 753524\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP432268] 16 Jan 2024 @ 683.0 hrs

