
[[225622 IAA]] VOLVO L90H 624597 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP441950
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 225622 IAA

PACWEST MACHINERY8207 SOUTH 216TH STREETKENT, WAUS  98032Contact: DAN SLAGLEdslagle@pacwestmachinery.comT: (206)482-4179F: (509)534-5286
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Piston, ringand cylinder wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO1271Unique No: 10845920Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 26 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 06069243 (Generated: 01/26/2024 11:39:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441950 VCP403268 VCP371200 VCP344834Sample Date 10 Jan 2024 29 Jun 2023 11 Jun 2023 24 Jan 2022Machine Hours 6875 6547 0 3876Oil Hours 0 200 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ChangedSample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 13.1 13.1 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 11.1 10.7 10.1 10.5Oxidation (PA) % 81 79 88 103
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.5 0.4 1.2 1.5Nitration (PA) % 60 59 87 108Sulfation (PA) % 64 62 69 75Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 216 44 169 25Sodium ppm 19 5 18 0Potassium ppm 9 1 6 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 111 51 230 39Copper ppm 3 2 10 2Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 1 4 2Aluminum ppm 61 13 56 10Chromium ppm 15 7 25 3Molybdenum ppm 39 39 41 43Nickel ppm 2 2 8 0Titanium ppm 5 1 4 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 <1 3 1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1665 1509 1728 1857Magnesium ppm 506 556 491 560Zinc ppm 1029 1048 1073 1037Phosphorus ppm 890 867 853 995Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1Boron ppm 39 38 29 31

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1271 [WUSCAR] 06069243 (Generated: 01/26/2024 11:39:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAN SLAGLE - VOLVO1271
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 624597\Diesel Engine [VCP441950] 10 Jan 2024 @ 6875.0 hrs

