
[[3017]] VOLVO EC380EL 310195 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP382955
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 3017

LEONARDS CONTRACTING30850 STEPHENSON HWYMADISON HEIGHTS, MIUS  48071Contact: LARRY SCHRADElarry.schrade@sdevelop.comT: (810)499-1953F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: LEOMADUnique No: 10846873Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 Jan 2024
Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06070196 (Generated: 01/29/2024 11:42:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP382955 VCP383275 VCP358379 VCP293813Sample Date 04 Jan 2024 18 Jul 2023 09 Jan 2023 09 Feb 2021Machine Hours 5715 5200 4735 3030Oil Hours 0 0 500 500Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.6 12.6 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.9 9.9 10.0 ---Oxidation (PA) % 83 81 80 80
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 63 62 59 76Sulfation (PA) % 61 60 61 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.9 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 7 1Sodium ppm 0 2 <1 2Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 0 5 4 7Copper ppm 0 <1 <1 5Lead ppm <1 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 38 41 41 35Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1589 1829 1657 1637Magnesium ppm 500 554 466 527Zinc ppm 1082 1220 1044 1014Phosphorus ppm 911 1014 880 909Barium ppm 0 <1 1 0Boron ppm 41 51 44 50

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEOMAD [WUSCAR] 06070196 (Generated: 01/29/2024 11:42:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: LARRY SCHRADE - LEOMAD
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC380EL 310195\Diesel Engine [VCP382955] 04 Jan 2024 @ 5715.0 hrs

