
[[CON SUR]] TAKEUCHI TL8R NOT GIVEN VCP429403 (S/N NO INFO ON SIF/BOTTLE) - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP429403
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: CON SUR

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample. We were unable toperform a particle count due to metalparticles present in thissample.Moderate concentration ofvisible metal present. All componentwear rates are normal. No othercontaminants were detected in theoil. The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10848237Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Jan 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06071560 (Generated: 02/01/2024 16:29:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429403 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Dec 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1597 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 90.2 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 2.58 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 48 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1399 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 634 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1105 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 977 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 50 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06071560 (Generated: 02/01/2024 16:29:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL8R NOT GIVEN VCP429403 (S/N NO INFO ON SIF/BOTTLE)\Hydraulic System [VCP429403] 05 Dec 2023 @ 1597.0 hrs

